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The New York Times bestselling author John Hart raved that "If you like stories of good people struggling to
do right in the world's forgotten places, there is no one better suited than Corban Addison to take you on the
ride of your life." In The Garden of Burning Sand, Addison, the bestselling author of A Walk Across the Sun,
creates a powerful and poignant novel that takes the reader from the red light areas of Lusaka, Zambia, to the
gilded chambers of the Washington, D.C. elite, to the splendor of Victoria Falls and Cape Town.

Zoe Fleming, an accomplished young human rights attorney, has made a life for herself in Zambia, far from
her estranged father--an American business mogul with presidential aspirations--and from the devastating
betrayals of her past.

When a young girl with Down syndrome is sexually assaulted in a Lusaka slum, Zoe joins Zambian police
officer Joseph Kabuta in investigating the rape. Piecing together clues from the victim's past, they discover
an unsettling connection between the girl--Kuyeya--and a powerful Zambian family who will stop at nothing
to bury the truth.

As they are drawn deeper into the complex web of characters behind this appalling crime, Zoe and Joseph
forge a bond of trust and friendship that slowly transforms into love. Opposed on all sides, they find
themselves caught in a dangerous clash between the forces of justice and power. To successfully prosecute
Kuyeya's attacker and build a future with Joseph, Zoe must risk her life and her heart--and confront the dark
past she thought she had left behind.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Brandon Li:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that
publication has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
can be reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person
who don't like reading a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will need this The Garden of Burning Sand.

Thomas Barreto:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to see? May be the book with the title The Garden of
Burning Sand suitable to you? The particular book was written by renowned writer in this era. Typically the
book untitled The Garden of Burning Sandis the one of several books that everyone read now. This kind of
book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new way of
measuring that you ever know before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to recognise the core of this publication. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world in this book.

Paul Norris:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more precious than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you should do is just
spending your time almost no but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of several books in the
top checklist in your reading list is usually The Garden of Burning Sand. This book that is certainly qualified
as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and
review this guide you can get many advantages.

Neil Owens:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's internal or
real their leisure activity. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring along with can't
see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says,
many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore , this The Garden of Burning Sand can make you sense
more interested to read.
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