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Recognize and activate who you have become-a God magnet, a walking revival waiting to happen! Do you
long for more of His presence? Do you desire a greater revelation of His love for you? Are you wanting to
hear His voice more clearly in your life? Your journey as a believer is about to get a turbo-boost as you
discover that you are an irresistible God magnet. God Magnet will help you to: Grasp the life-changing
revelation of how deeply you are loved by God-you are a magnet to the One who is deeply attracted to you!
Clearly understand your new, unique identity in Christ. You are no longer a helpless sinner trying to survive
until Christ comes, but a sacred temple to whom God is attracted-one He loves to live in. Learn to hear God's
voice for yourself. Hearing from Him personally will awaken a deep, relentless desire for more of His
supernatural works in your life. Be empowered to live from a different mindset. You will discover that the
effectiveness of your life is not rooted in your own performance or strength, but in resting in the One who
lives within you.
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From reader reviews:

Elinor Russell:

This book untitled God Magnet: You are a Walking Revival Waiting to Happen to be one of several books
that best seller in this year, that is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it.
You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you can order it by way of online. The publisher in this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, since you can read this book in your
Smart phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this publication from your list.

Enrique Flora:

Often the book God Magnet: You are a Walking Revival Waiting to Happen has a lot of knowledge on it. So
when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous
author. This articles author makes some research prior to write this book. This particular book very easy to
read you can find the point easily after reading this article book.

Cheree Kramer:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this God Magnet: You are a Walking
Revival Waiting to Happen e-book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book
which might be understand by anyone who all read the book. Written inside good manner for you, still
dripping wet every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question
God Magnet: You are a Walking Revival Waiting to Happen as good book not simply by the cover but also
with the content. This is one e-book that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still
needing one more sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so
why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Latonya Sams:

It is possible to spend your free time to study this book this e-book. This God Magnet: You are a Walking
Revival Waiting to Happen is simple to deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and
soon. If you did not get much space to bring the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make
you simpler to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that
you will get when one buys this book.
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