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Tony Buzan knows more than a little about Mind Maps – after all, he did invent them!

 

Often referred to as the ‘the Swiss-army knife for the brain’, Mind Maps are a ground-breaking, note-taking
and mind-organising technique that has already revolutionised the lives of many millions of people around
the world and taken the educational world by storm.

 

Now Tony Buzan is sharing the powerful techniques of mind mapping with the business world to help
business professionals everywhere revolutionise the way they think and practise.

 

Mind Maps for Business  is the very first and only book on mind mapping that has been written by Tony
Buzan specifically for a business audience.

 

No matter how big or small the business you work in; no matter if you’re an employer or an employee; no
matter what your role is, you’ll find the benefits of using mind maps to help you think, organise, plan and
control are vast:

Accelerate your productivity to levels you never thought possible.●

Generate exciting new possibilities for growth and expansion.●

Make meetings, discussions and forums really productive and useful.●

Negotiate, talk and consult more constructively and effectively.●

Be more focussed, more organised and much smarter.●

Unleash your amazing creative capabilities.●

 

Whether you’re writing marketing plans or strategy documents; looking for new ways to develop your
business; planning a conference or event; restructuring your staff; or looking to improve your management
and leadership skills – discover today the amazing advantages that using  Mind Maps for Business  can
bring.
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan Woods:

The book Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to revolutionise how you work
(2nd Edition) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want.
Why then must we leave a good thing like a book Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate
thinking tool to revolutionise how you work (2nd Edition)? Several of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer
using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to revolutionise
how you work (2nd Edition) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can appear the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Frances Barrett:

Here thing why this specific Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to
revolutionise how you work (2nd Edition) are different and reliable to be yours. First of all looking at a book
is good nonetheless it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as delicious as food or not.
Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to revolutionise how you work (2nd
Edition) giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any publication out there but
there is no publication that similar with Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to
revolutionise how you work (2nd Edition). It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your own
eyes about the thing which happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is
possible to bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your way home by train. If you are having
difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the
ultimate thinking tool to revolutionise how you work (2nd Edition) in e-book can be your alternate.

Tony Partee:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or playing
video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day to reading a
publication. The book Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to revolutionise
how you work (2nd Edition) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended
this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space bringing this
book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from a smart phone. The
price is not very costly but this book has high quality.



Cynthia Campbell:

The book untitled Mind Maps for Business 2nd edn: Using the ultimate thinking tool to revolutionise how
you work (2nd Edition) contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the girl idea with easy way.
The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that.
The book was written by famous author. The author gives you in the new time of literary works. You can
read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book
throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official
web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice read.
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