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The Language Centre was founded in 1970 as a language research department in the University of Ghana,
under the then Faculty of Arts. Its mandate was to focus on research and teaching related to the improvement
of performance in English, the official language, and the various Ghanaian languages as vectors of
education, culture and community interaction. Since the 1970s, the Centre has been focusing on research
related to language learning, teaching and assessment, language endangerment and documentation,
multilingualism, intercultural communication, and the interconnected areas of language and literature. This
book, in essence, reflects these research areas, but more than that the constitutive research articles were
produced jointly or severally by different generations of directors and research fellows of the Centre, over
the four decades of the organization's existence. The ten chapters of this commemorative anthology comprise
selected research articles from a very large pool of previously published works with continuing relevance, as
well as more recent works that have not yet been published. The book is not designed for release as a discrete
and independent publication. On the contrary, it feeds into a much wider set of commemorative collections
from diverse units, all of which are thematically linked in a manner designed to project the mission of the
University of Ghana.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Fincher:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication The Girl Who Can and
Other Stories will make you to be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about
everything. But some of you think in which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is far from
make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Colleen Key:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its deal with may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer may be The Girl Who Can and Other Stories why because the wonderful
cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content
is fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this
book.

Robert Russo:

Reading a book to become new life style in this year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what
forms of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education
books, but if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as soon.
The The Girl Who Can and Other Stories offer you a new experience in looking at a book.

Latashia Bartlett:

Book is one of source of expertise. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also native or
citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year for you to year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the world. With the
book The Girl Who Can and Other Stories we can have more advantage. Don't someone to be creative
people? To get creative person must like to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that suited with
your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this time book The Girl Who Can and Other Stories. You can
more attractive than now.
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