
The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C#
Roy Osherove

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=1617290890
http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=1617290890
http://linebook.us/go/read.php?id=1617290890


The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C#

Roy Osherove

The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C# Roy Osherove

Summary

The Art of Unit Testing, Second Edition guides you step by step from writing your first simple tests to
developing robust test sets that are maintainable, readable, and trustworthy. You'll master the foundational
ideas and quickly move to high-value subjects like mocks, stubs, and isolation, including frameworks such as
Moq, FakeItEasy, and Typemock Isolator. You'll explore test patterns and organization, working with legacy
code, and even "untestable" code. Along the way, you'll learn about integration testing and techniques and
tools for testing databases and other technologies.

About this Book

You know you should be unit testing, so why aren't you doing it? If you're new to unit testing, if you find
unit testing tedious, or if you're just not getting enough payoff for the effort you put into it, keep reading.

The Art of Unit Testing, Second Edition guides you step by step from writing your first simple unit tests to
building complete test sets that are maintainable, readable, and trustworthy. You'll move quickly to more
complicated subjects like mocks and stubs, while learning to use isolation (mocking) frameworks like Moq,
FakeItEasy, and Typemock Isolator. You'll explore test patterns and organization, refactor code applications,
and learn how to test "untestable" code. Along the way, you'll learn about integration testing and techniques
for testing with databases.

The examples in the book use C#, but will benefit anyone using a statically typed language such as Java or
C++.

Purchase of the print book includes a free eBook in PDF, Kindle, and ePub formats from Manning
Publications.

What's Inside

Create readable, maintainable, trustworthy tests●

Fakes, stubs, mock objects, and isolation (mocking) frameworks●

Simple dependency injection techniques●

Refactoring legacy code●

About the Author

Roy Osherove has been coding for over 15 years, and he consults and trains teams worldwide on the gentle
art of unit testing and test-driven development. His blog is at ArtOfUnitTesting.com.
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From reader reviews:

Helen McCormick:

Often the book The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C# will bring you to definitely the new experience
of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to learn,
this book very ideal to you. The book The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C# is much recommended
to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more easily to read the
book.

Judith Lea:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or perhaps playing
video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity here is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the whole day
to reading a reserve. The book The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C# it doesn't matter what good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. We were holding enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore quickly
to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses high quality.

Donna Lacher:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C#, you
are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it?
Oh can occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Domingo Adams:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Art of Unit Testing: with examples in C# can
be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time
by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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