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Between the pages of this book lies the secret to the best-tasting chocolate in all the world. I promise, your
taste buds will tingle. Your palette will sing! Oh no, have I accidentally tempted you to read this book? I will
warn you, however, the most delicious things are never good for you...and this story is particularly
scrumptious!

In this tooth-rotting adventure, Cass's mom has been kidnapped by the evil dessert chef and chocolatier,
Señor Hugo! The ransom...the legendary tuning fork. Can Cass and Max-Ernest find the magical instrument
before it's too late? Will they discover the evil secret ingredient to Señor Hugo's chocolate success?

If you're tempted, take a taste, but just remember...this book is not good for you.
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From reader reviews:

Leta Welter:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare
time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book eligible
This Book Is Not Good For You (Secret, Bk 3)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with its
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Mary Gines:

What do you about book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want something to
explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have
extra time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They need to answer that question since
just their can do this. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on kindergarten until university need this kind of This Book Is Not Good For You
(Secret, Bk 3) to read.

George Finch:

Beside this kind of This Book Is Not Good For You (Secret, Bk 3) in your phone, it can give you a way to
get more close to the new knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here
is fresh in the oven so don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow village. It is good thing to
have This Book Is Not Good For You (Secret, Bk 3) because this book offers to you personally readable
information. Do you at times have book but you rarely get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will
not end up to happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the idea? Find this book in addition
to read it from now!

Elizabeth Talbot:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many problem for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading.
Some people likes reading through, not only science book but additionally novel and This Book Is Not Good
For You (Secret, Bk 3) or others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly
amazing a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher or
students especially. Those publications are helping them to increase their knowledge. In various other case,
beside science e-book, any other book likes This Book Is Not Good For You (Secret, Bk 3) to make your
spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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