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The Library of America and editor Sarah Weinman redefine the classic era of American crime fiction
with a landmark collection of four brilliant novels by the female pioneers of the genre, the women who
paved the way for Gillian Flynn, Tana French, and Lisa Scottoline.   
Though women crime and suspense writers dominate today’s bestseller lists, the extraordinary work of the
mid-century pioneers of the genre is largely unknown. Turning in many cases from the mean streets of the
hardboiled school to explore the anxieties and terrors lurking in everyday life, these groundbreaking
novelists found the roots of fear and violence in a quiet suburban neighborhood, on a college campus, or in a
comfortable midtown hotel. Their work, influential in its day and still vibrant and extraordinarily riveting
today, is long overdue for rediscovery. This volume, the second of a two-volume collector’s set, gathers four
classic works that together reveal the vital and unacknowledged lineage to today’s leading crime writers.
From the 1950s here are Charlotte Armstrong’s Mischief, the nightmarish drama of a child entrusted to a
psychotic babysitter, Patricia Highsmith’s The Blunderer, brilliantly tracking the perverse parallel lives of
two men driven toward murder, Margaret Millar’s Beast in View, a relentless study in madness, and Dolores
Hitchens’s Fools' Gold, a hard-edged tale of robbery and redemption.
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From reader reviews:

George Marsh:

The book untitled Women Crime Writers: Four Suspense Novels of the 1950s: Mischief / The Blunderer /
Beast in View / Fools' Gold (Library of America) is the reserve that recommended to you to study. You can
see the quality of the book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of exploration when write the
book, to ensure the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also will get the
e-book of Women Crime Writers: Four Suspense Novels of the 1950s: Mischief / The Blunderer / Beast in
View / Fools' Gold (Library of America) from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Lupe Ware:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray an individual, why because this Women Crime Writers: Four
Suspense Novels of the 1950s: Mischief / The Blunderer / Beast in View / Fools' Gold (Library of America)
book written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make book that may be understand by
anyone who all read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing
skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question Women Crime Writers: Four Suspense
Novels of the 1950s: Mischief / The Blunderer / Beast in View / Fools' Gold (Library of America) as good
book not merely by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that can break don't ascertain
book by its include, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your
examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Emily Meredith:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the top list
in your reading list is Women Crime Writers: Four Suspense Novels of the 1950s: Mischief / The Blunderer /
Beast in View / Fools' Gold (Library of America). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can
get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you can get many
advantages.

Gregory Kile:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
issue was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. So
you know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update about something by book. Different



categories of books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is niagra Women Crime Writers: Four
Suspense Novels of the 1950s: Mischief / The Blunderer / Beast in View / Fools' Gold (Library of America).
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