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The Wonderful Wizard of Oz
One of the true classics of American literature. Originally published in 1900, it was the first truly American
fairy tale, as Baum crafted a wonderful fantasy, peopled with memorable characters?a cornfield scarecrow,
Tin Woodman, and a humbug wizard.

Follow the adventures of young Dorothy Gale and her dog, Toto, as their Kansas house is swept away by a
cyclone and they find themselves in a strange land called Oz. Here she meets the Munchkins and joins the
Scarecrow, the Tinman, and the Cowardly Lion on an unforgettable journey to the Emerald City.

The Marvelous Land of Oz
Tip, a young Gillikin boy, runs away from his cruel guardian, the wicked witch Mombi. He meets up with
the Scarecrow, now ruler of the Emerald City, the Tin Woodman, many new friends, and an army of girls
who want to overthrow the Scarecrow. Before it's over, Tip finds out that he is part of a dark secret from Oz's
past.

Ozma of Oz
Dorothy Gale, on a voyage at sea, is tossed overboard during a storm. She is washed ashore at Ev, a country
neighboring Oz, where she meets up with her old friends the Scarecrow, the Tin Woodman, and the
Cowardly Lion. She also meets Ozma, the new Princess of Oz, who has come to Ev on a mission of her own,
which will bring them all in contact with the nefarious Nome King.

Dorothy and the Wizard in Oz
In this adventure, Dorothy gets caught in a California earthquake with her cousin Zeb, and they have many
adventures underground with none other than the Wizard of Oz! But can they find their way back to the
surface world?

The Road to Oz
While guiding a lost traveler, Dorothy gets lost and finds herself on an enchanted road headed yet again to
Oz. She meets many new friends and dangers along the way?but can she get to the Emerald City in time for
Ozma's birthday party?

The Emerald City of Oz
Dorothy Gale and her Uncle Henry and Aunt Em are coming to live in Oz permanently. Dorothy then takes
them on a tour of Oz, and during their journey they encounter King Kleaver with his Spoon Brigade and



Miss Cuttenclip of the land of paper dolls. Meanwhile, the wicked Nome King has joined forces with the
horrible Growleywogs, the terrifying Whimsies, and the wicked Phanfasms in a plot to capture the Emerald
City.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Steele:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a stroll, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book entitled Oz Family
Collection: The Wonderful Wizard of Oz, The Marvelous Land of Oz, Ozma of Oz, Dorothy and the Wizard
in Oz, The Road to Oz, The Emerald City of Oz? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You realize beside
you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can wiser than before. Do you agree with their opinion
or you have other opinion?

John Harrison:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive at this point, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is reading. Yeah,
by reading a e-book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is high. To suit
your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Oz Family Collection: The Wonderful
Wizard of Oz, The Marvelous Land of Oz, Ozma of Oz, Dorothy and the Wizard in Oz, The Road to Oz, The
Emerald City of Oz book as beginning and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is usually more than
just a book.

Lisa Shumaker:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Examining a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Oz Family Collection: The Wonderful
Wizard of Oz, The Marvelous Land of Oz, Ozma of Oz, Dorothy and the Wizard in Oz, The Road to Oz, The
Emerald City of Oz book because this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the info in
this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Christie Rich:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This specific book Oz Family Collection: The Wonderful Wizard of
Oz, The Marvelous Land of Oz, Ozma of Oz, Dorothy and the Wizard in Oz, The Road to Oz, The Emerald
City of Oz was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Oz Family
Collection: The Wonderful Wizard of Oz, The Marvelous Land of Oz, Ozma of Oz, Dorothy and the Wizard
in Oz, The Road to Oz, The Emerald City of Oz has many kinds or category. Start from kids until teenagers.
For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. So , not at



all of book are generally make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best
book for you and try to like reading this.
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