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Roughing It follows the travels of young Mark Twain through the Wild West during the years 1861–1867.
After a brief stint as a Confederate cavalry militiaman, he joined his brother Orion Clemens, who had been
appointed Secretary of the Nevada Territory, on a stagecoach journey west. Twain consulted his brother's
diary to refresh his memory and borrowed heavily from his active imagination for many stories in the novel.

Roughing It illustrates many of Twain's early adventures, including a visit to Salt Lake City, gold and silver
prospecting, real-estate speculation, and his beginnings as a writer.

In this memoir, readers can see examples of Twain's rough-hewn humor, which would become a staple of his
writing in his later books, such as Adventures of Huckleberry Finn, The Adventures of Tom Sawyer, and A
Connecticut Yankee in King Arthur's Court.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Martinez:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Roughing It: (Annotated), you may
enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh
can occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Lawrence Elam:

In this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you should do
is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the books in the top
record in your reading list is Roughing It: (Annotated). This book which can be qualified as The Hungry
Mountains can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upward and review this book you
can get many advantages.

Elsie Wallace:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library as well as
to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now
there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and also can't
see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this Roughing It: (Annotated) can make you experience more interested to
read.

Michael Major:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from a book. Book is composed or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update
of news. In this particular modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an
individual. From media social like newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel
and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your
book? Or just trying to find the Roughing It: (Annotated) when you required it?
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