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Promise Me: It has been six years since entertainment agent Myron Bolitar last played superhero. In six
years he hasn’t thrown a punch. He hasn’t held, much less fired, a gun. He hasn’t called his friend Win, still
the scariest man he knows, to back him up or get him out of trouble. All that is about to change...because of a
promise. The Woods: Twenty years ago, four teenagers at summer camp walked into the woods at night.
Two were found murdered, and the others were never seen again. For Paul Copeland, the county prosecutor
of Essex, New Jersey, mourning the loss of his sister has only recently begun to subside. When a homicide
victim is found with evidence linking him to Cope, the well-buried secrets of the prosecutor’s family are
threatened. Is this homicide victim one of the campers who disappeared with his sister? Could his sister be
alive? Hold Tight: Tia and Mike Baye never imagined they’d become the type of overprotective parents who
spy on their kids. But their sixteen-year-old son Adam has been unusually distant lately, and after the suicide
of his classmate Spencer Hill they install a spy program on Adam’s computer, and within days they are jolted
by a message addressed to their son: “Just stay quiet and all safe.” When Adam goes missing, it soon
becomes clear that something deep and sinister has infected their community. For Tia and Mike Baye, the
question they must answer is this: When it comes to your kids, is it possible to know too much?
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From reader reviews:

David Carson:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection: Promise Me, The
Woods, Hold Tight. You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Provided that we know about
how is important the book Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection: Promise Me, The Woods, Hold Tight.
You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply
because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you may be
known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we can easily open a
book as well as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel
uninterested to go to the library. Let's study.

Norma Harrell:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. We all
know that that book is very important usually. The book Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection: Promise
Me, The Woods, Hold Tight was making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take
more information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection:
Promise Me, The Woods, Hold Tight is not only giving you far more new information but also to become
your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to
make relationship while using book Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection: Promise Me, The Woods,
Hold Tight. You never sense lose out for everything if you read some books.

Rick Fountain:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching
TV, as well as playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read a book. It is really fun for you personally. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent
the entire day to reading a guide. The book Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection: Promise Me, The
Woods, Hold Tight it is quite good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These
were enjoying reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy
often the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too
costly but this book has high quality.

Kathleen Jones:

Beside this kind of Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection: Promise Me, The Woods, Hold Tight in your
phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the
knowledge you are going to got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an
previous people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have Harlan Coben Unabridged CD Collection:



Promise Me, The Woods, Hold Tight because this book offers to you readable information. Do you
sometimes have book but you seldom get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not happen if you
have this within your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful
island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book and also read it from now!
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