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There is no doubt that America is in the midst of a spiritual crisis.  Millions of people are trying to find
meaning in their lives by returning to old-time religions, or by seeking out new cults, fads, channelers, 12-
step programs, and self-help books. Bill Moyers has called this search for spirituality "the biggest story -- not
only of the decade but of the century."  Now, Sam Keen, the New York Times bestselling author of Fire in
the Belly, addresses this crisis and provides a blueprint for bringing spirituality into everyday life in Hymns
to an Unknown God:  Awakening the Spirit in Everyday Life.

Using practical examples from his and other people's lives, Keen tells readers how to cut through what he
calls the "spiritual bullshit," and recover the sacred in their love affairs, families, jobs, and politics -- in short,
how to recover the "Unknown God." Down-to-earth and articulate, Sam Keen is a popular social
commentator, philosopher, and teacher. He describes himself as "overeducated at the Ivies," with degrees
from Harvard and Princeton. His work has been featured in a special Bill Moyers PBS interview, and for
over twenty years he was a consulting editor at Psychology Today.

How to Use Your Spiritual Bullshit Detector: In a world of one-minute solutions, false spiritual leaders, and
instant spirituality, how can you tell which beliefs are valid and separate the bogus from the genuine.

Sex and the Spirit: Why is it that sex and spirituality are so interconnected and confusing? Keen explains the
conflict between "I want" and "I should," and tells readers how to integrate sensuality, sexuality and
spirituality to experience truly deep and loving relationships.

Consecrating Our Days: Rituals for Living: Keen gives more than a dozen suggestions for personal rituals to
remind readers of the sacredness in their everyday lives, including creating a private place as a personal
sanctuary, learning to make time to think deeply, setting aside personal days as times of celebration, and
more.
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From reader reviews:

Ann Lemieux:

The experience that you get from Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening The Spirit In Everyday Life will
be the more deep you digging the information that hide in the words the more you get thinking about reading
it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to know but Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening The Spirit In
Everyday Life giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a number of way that
can be understood by simply anyone who read the idea because the author of this publication is well-known
enough. That book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to understand then
can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for having this particular
Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening The Spirit In Everyday Life instantly.

Adria Jenkins:

The e-book untitled Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening The Spirit In Everyday Life is the guide that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
article author was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share for your
requirements is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening
The Spirit In Everyday Life from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

William Bellard:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening
The Spirit In Everyday Life guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that
could be understand by anyone who have read the book. Written within good manner for you, dripping every
ideas and producing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still question Hymns to an
Unknown God: Awakening The Spirit In Everyday Life as good book not simply by the cover but also
through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't ascertain book by its handle, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already
said so why you have to listening to an additional sixth sense.

Weston Brock:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many query for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but additionally novel and Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening The
Spirit In Everyday Life or maybe others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the
truly great a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created for teacher as well
as students especially. Those publications are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case,
beside science reserve, any other book likes Hymns to an Unknown God: Awakening The Spirit In Everyday



Life to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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