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For thirty-three-year-old millionaire James Sullivan, sweeping Lita McClinton off her feet was easy. But
when the reckless social climber and adulterer turned marriage in their Palm Beach mansion into a luxurious
hell, the beautiful Georgia debutante wanted out-and half of her husband's fortune to take with her.

Then in 1987, a hit man unloaded three bullets into Lita's head.

Her family demanded justice. James had other plans-and the money to insure it. But it wasn't until eleven
years later that a startling confession from a surprise witness would bring James Sullivan's comfortable life
crashing down around him. The cold-blooded millionaire was indicted and fled the country turning hotspots
across the globe into exotic private playgrounds before settling with his new fiancée in a sumptuous resort
near Bangkok, where he was arrested four years later. From Palm Beach elite to life in a squalid Thailand jail
cell this is the astonishing true story of one man's flight from justice and one family's burning desire to make
him pay.
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From reader reviews:

Kina Chatman:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe
may update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to a person
is you don't know which one you should start with. This The Palm Beach Murder (St. Martin's True Crime
Library) is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and
want in this era.

Ollie Waymire:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading addiction give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book which improve your knowledge and information. The details you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want have more knowledge just go with training books but if you want feel happy read one
having theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the The Palm Beach Murder (St. Martin's
True Crime Library) is kind of reserve which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Elizabeth Smith:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the subject The Palm
Beach Murder (St. Martin's True Crime Library) suitable to you? The particular book was written by well
known writer in this era. Often the book untitled The Palm Beach Murder (St. Martin's True Crime
Library)is the main one of several books that will everyone read now. This specific book was inspired many
people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know
before. The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to understand the
core of this e-book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. To help you to see
the represented of the world on this book.

Crystal Lavigne:

The book untitled The Palm Beach Murder (St. Martin's True Crime Library) contain a lot of information on
that. The writer explains her idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the
people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author.
The author will bring you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you can continue
reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site as well as order it. Have
a nice go through.
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