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The IDEA Workbook for IDEA Version Nine is an in-depth tutorial applying IDEA tests and analyses to
audits and investigations in accounts receivable, accounts payable/fraud investigation and inventory. The
IDEA tests and analyses increase in complexity, building on the experience learned in earlier sections.
Included in these sections are: An assessment of potential risks with business and audit implications A list of
the potential tests Audit objectives with IDEA lesson objectives to reinforce the reasoning behind the tests
Step-by-step instructions with solutions Additional sections provide information on topics such as data
requirements; designing and printing reports, re-running tasks, managing IDEA use; and provides potential
tests for sales transactions, travel expenses, payroll and access controls that could be performed using IDEA.
Data files are included on a CD with the hardcopy version. Participants of the IDEA Academic Partnership
receive a complimentary copy of the Workbook and students of participating colleges/universities receive a
discount. Student copies of the IDEA Workbook include the IDEA Education Version, user guides, case
study and other applicable data files.
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From reader reviews:

Manuel Thomas:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important
thing for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim as well as goal; it means
that publication has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book.
They are reading whatever they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. How about the person
who don't like reading a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book once they found difficult problem
or perhaps exercise. Well, probably you should have this IDEA Data Analysis Software for Idea Version
Seven (Workbook).

Guadalupe Marshall:

The book IDEA Data Analysis Software for Idea Version Seven (Workbook) can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a
book IDEA Data Analysis Software for Idea Version Seven (Workbook)? Wide variety you have a different
opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right
now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you are able to give for
each other; you may share all of these. Book IDEA Data Analysis Software for Idea Version Seven
(Workbook) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the
enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Jack Rolfes:

The reserve untitled IDEA Data Analysis Software for Idea Version Seven (Workbook) is the book that
recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The
language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of
exploration when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You
also could possibly get the e-book of IDEA Data Analysis Software for Idea Version Seven (Workbook)
from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Oscar Barr:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family
or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to take the book everywhere?
It alright you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like IDEA Data
Analysis Software for Idea Version Seven (Workbook) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try
out this book? Let's notice.
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