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Bon vivant and expert sleuth Sam Levitt and his partner in love and intrigue, Elena Morales, return in the
latest installment of the delightfully sun-splashed Provençal Caper series.

When a Riviera socialite’s diamonds are stolen—the latest in a string of seemingly unconnected but ever-
more-audacious jewelry heists across France—Elena flies in to investigate the insurance claim. It’s a trip
she’s more than happy to make, as it gives her a chance to meet up with old friends in Marseille—and,
particularly, with Sam.

Once reunited, Sam isn’t entirely distracted by domestic matters. In the pattern of these “perfect crimes” he's
beginning to see a master at work, and he’s quickly determined to connect and solve the cases. But as he and
Elena dig deeper, they begin to realize just how much is connected and how dangerous it may be to pursue
the whole truth.

Meanwhile, there’s a house to renovate, rosé to share, and feasts of Provençal summer bounty to enjoy. Full
of Peter Mayle’s inimitable wit and style, The Diamond Caper is sure to charm faithful fans and new readers
alike.
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From reader reviews:

Jeanne Linder:

The book The Diamond Caper make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable
far more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using
your subject. If you can make reading a book The Diamond Caper to be your habit, you can get much more
advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You may
know everything if you like start and read a publication The Diamond Caper. Kinds of book are several. It
means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this publication?

Annie Smith:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what your own problem? How about your time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time?
What did you do? Every person has many questions above. They should answer that question simply because
just their can do that will. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of The Diamond Caper to read.

Beverly Thomas:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Diamond Caper can be the
answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by
reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the
others?

Roger Richmond:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many query for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but in addition novel and The Diamond Caper or maybe others
sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel need to read
more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those guides are
helping them to bring their knowledge. In other case, beside science e-book, any other book likes The
Diamond Caper to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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