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With her tenth wedding anniversary barely two weeks away, the only gift Kate wants is to spend a week
alone. After all, life with Ethan has become so cold and distant, it’s a strain just being together. But Ethan
wants just the opposite and his indecent proposal at dinner is a shock that rocks Kate’s world off its axis and
into a sensual world of possibility. Will Kate fulfill Ethan’s fantasy? Is their relationship even worth saving?
Just how far is she willing to go to save her marriage? The Anniversary Gift is a story of two people
struggling to rekindle the love and passion that brought them together to begin with, a journey of re-
connection, exploration and love.
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From reader reviews:

Rosa Flint:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Anniversary Gift: The Re-Connection Series
(Volume 1) as the daily resource information.

Anna Wright:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Anniversary Gift: The Re-
Connection Series (Volume 1), you can enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss
it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh
come on its identified as reading friends.

Agnes Figueroa:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You
can observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended for you is The Anniversary Gift: The Re-Connection Series (Volume 1) this e-book consist a
lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just how can
the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. Often the
writer made some research when he makes this book. This is why this book acceptable all of you.

Liliana Stevens:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many problem for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but novel and The Anniversary Gift: The Re-Connection Series (Volume 1)
as well as others sources were given information for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel
would like to read more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or maybe students especially.
Those textbooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science book, any
other book likes The Anniversary Gift: The Re-Connection Series (Volume 1) to make your spare time far



more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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