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A trusty companion for the slow and thoughtful home and the inner utilitarian in us all, The Kaufmann
Mercantile Guide: How to Split Wood, Shuck an Oyster and Master Other Simple Pleasures allows you to
experience the singular satisfaction of doing it yourself. Each project, whether caring for cast iron or planting
with the seasons, is supplemented with expert tips to inspire and empower. Organized into five
sections—Kitchen, Outdoors, Home, Gardening, and Grooming—the comprehensive guide features detailed
instructions and original artwork for tasks both simple, such as brewing the perfect cup of coffee, and
exploratory, such as fording a stream and reading the sky. Accompanying the how-tos are tried-and-true
products selected from the Kaufmann Mercantile store that not only help one get the job done but are also a
joy to use.

As editors Alexandra Redgrave and Jessica Hundley describe in the introduction, "This book began out of a
curiosity for how we grow, build, and craft the world around us. We discovered that there's an art to a simple
task done well - it calls for consideration and creativity, the rolling up of sleeves, and the digging into of
details. It means getting messy, and, perhaps, messing up. In our world of modern convenience, doing it
yourself is immensely rewarding. And so, consider the book in your hands as a starting point. We hope you,
like us, find inspiration in these pages to experiment, to investigate, to create, and to enlighten your
everyday."
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From reader reviews:

Rodney Schmitt:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add
your knowledge by the book entitled The Kaufmann Mercantile Guide: How to Split Wood, Shuck an
Oyster, and Master Other Simple Pleasures. Try to face the book The Kaufmann Mercantile Guide: How to
Split Wood, Shuck an Oyster, and Master Other Simple Pleasures as your friend. It means that it can to get
your friend when you sense alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is
very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know almost
everything by the book. So , let's make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Megan Snyder:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the time or they will get great deal of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have when
the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you have read is
usually The Kaufmann Mercantile Guide: How to Split Wood, Shuck an Oyster, and Master Other Simple
Pleasures.

Dora Vazquez:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is called of book
The Kaufmann Mercantile Guide: How to Split Wood, Shuck an Oyster, and Master Other Simple Pleasures.
Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make
anyone happier to read. It is most significant that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one
location to other place.

Matthew Hansen:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a book. They are directly felt this when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose the particular book The Kaufmann Mercantile Guide: How
to Split Wood, Shuck an Oyster, and Master Other Simple Pleasures to make your own reading is interesting.
Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you including reading. Try to choose basic book to
make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion
for you to like to open up a book and learn it. Beside that the reserve The Kaufmann Mercantile Guide: How
to Split Wood, Shuck an Oyster, and Master Other Simple Pleasures can to be your friend when you're truly
feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of their time.
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