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One of the most influential books in the Western philosophical and literary tradition, Sir Thomas More’s
Utopia appeared in 1516. The formidable Henry VIII had recently assumed the throne in England, and
conflicting ideas about religion were fuelling the Reformation throughout Europe. A scathing satire, Utopia
was hugely successful and vaulted More to the forefront of the growing humanist movement. The story of
Utopia is told by a mysterious sailor named Raphael Hythloday, who travels to the New World with the
Italian explorer Vespucci and remains at a fort built at the farthest point reached. From there, he discovers a
strange island kingdom named Utopia, a pagan and communist city-state in which language, social customs,
dress, architecture, and education are identical throughout the country’s fifty-four cities. The Utopians have
eliminated wealth, the nobility, and currency. Labour and goods are distributed equally and property is held
in common. And there are no monasteries, alehouses, or academies to tempt a person to withdraw from
society. Given More’s satiric leanings and eventual execution, is Utopia simply an attack on Europe’s
wickedness? Or is it a philosophical tract extolling the ideal way to live? Ultimately, Utopia navigates a
course between the desire to create perfection and the pragmatic understanding that perfection, given the
fallibility of mankind, is impossible. Includes unique illustrations.
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From reader reviews:

Christian Fowler:

Within other case, little individuals like to read book Utopia. You can choose the best book if you want
reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book Utopia. You can add
information and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can
know everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About
simple point until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or searching
by internet system. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's go
through.

Stewart Ramirez:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and move forward. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems coming to a
person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Utopia is our recommendation so you keep
up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Jessica Wilson:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are ride
on and with addition info. Even you love Utopia, you can enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still
need to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't get
it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Henry Stehle:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this time you only find reserve that need
more time to be read. Utopia can be your answer because it can be read by a person who have those short
spare time problems.
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