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The best-selling Fundamentals of Corporate Finance (FCF) is written with one strongly held principle– that
corporate finance should be developed and taught in terms of a few integrated, powerful ideas. As such, there
are three basic themes that are the central focus of the book: 1) An emphasis on intuition—underlying ideas
are discussed in general terms and then by way of examples that illustrate in more concrete terms how a
financial manager might proceed in a given situation. 2) A unified valuation approach—net present value
(NPV) is treated as the basic concept underlying corporate finance. Every subject covered is firmly rooted in
valuation, and care is taken to explain how particular decisions have valuation effects. 3) A managerial
focus—the authors emphasize the role of the financial manager as decision maker, and they stress the need
for managerial input and judgment.

The Ninth Edition continues the tradition of excellence that has earned Fundamentals of Corporate Finance
its status as market leader. Every chapter has been updated to provide the most current examples that reflect
corporate finance in today’s world. The supplements package has been updated and improved, and with the
new Excel Master online tool, student and instructor support has never been stronger.
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From reader reviews:

Aimee Nguyen:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed Loose-leaf Fundamentals of
Corporate Finance Standard Edition? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You already know beside
you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you agree with it is
opinion or you have some other opinion?

Clifford Harvey:

Here thing why this particular Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance Standard Edition are different
and dependable to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content of the usb
ports which is the content is as scrumptious as food or not. Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance
Standard Edition giving you information deeper since different ways, you can find any book out there but
there is no publication that similar with Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance Standard Edition. It
gives you thrill reading journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing that happened in the world
which is maybe can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in park your car, café,
or even in your way home by train. For anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe
the form of Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance Standard Edition in e-book can be your
alternative.

Maritza Berry:

This Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance Standard Edition are usually reliable for you who want
to be considered a successful person, why. The reason of this Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance
Standard Edition can be one of the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple
looking at food but feed an individual with information that possibly will shock your preceding knowledge.
This book is usually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-
book and printed kinds. Beside that this Loose-leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance Standard Edition
forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking
that we realize it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Anne Braden:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind skill
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to can satisfy
your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be examine. Loose-
leaf Fundamentals of Corporate Finance Standard Edition can be your answer because it can be read by an
individual who have those short extra time problems.
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