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This book is about U.S. policy makers who have wielded enormous influence, largely behind the scenes,
since the end of World War II. The advent of the Cold War brought new problems of national security for the
United States. As a result, U.S. presidents no longer sat down with their secretaries of state to determine the
nation's foreign policy. Instead, postwar chief executives reached out to individuals in the intelligence and
military organizations and, increasingly, to advisers in the White House. The Policy Makers examines seven
such advisers—from public servants in the state department to CIA directors and U.S. senators—and the
policies each adviser influenced. By focusing on individuals whose policy making role was often unknown
to the public, Anna Kasten Nelson and her contributors shed light on the myriad ways in which the postwar
foreign policy of the United States has been shaped, sometimes in ways very damaging to the nation's
security.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Overbay:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't would like
do that. You must know how great and important the book The Policy Makers: Shaping American Foreign
Policy from 1947 to the Present. All type of book would you see on many options. You can look for the
internet methods or other social media.

Dolores Parker:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared with
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to
be read. The Policy Makers: Shaping American Foreign Policy from 1947 to the Present can be your answer
as it can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.

Susan Martinez:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that
recommended to you is The Policy Makers: Shaping American Foreign Policy from 1947 to the Present this
e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world now. This kind of book was represented
how do the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand.
The writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That is why this book acceptable all of you.

Charles Anderson:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This The Policy Makers: Shaping American Foreign
Policy from 1947 to the Present can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out
of date, spending your free time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these
books have than the others?
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