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Richard and Karen Carpenter, as the Carpenters, are one of the best-selling music acts of all-time. Richard
and Karen made their breakthrough in 1969 when, on 22nd April, they signed to A&M Records. They agreed
they would be known as ‘Carpenters’, as opposed to ‘The Carpenters’. Richard composed ten of the 13 songs
on the duo’s debut album, OFFERING, but their debut single was a ballad version of the Beatles’ Ticket To
Ride, which was a minor hit on the Hot 100 in the USA. It wasn’t until they released their second album,
CLOSE TO YOU, that Richard and Karen’s career really took off. The lead single from the album, (They
Long To Be) Close To You, went all the way to no.1 in the USA, and broke the duo internationally. The
follow-up, We’ve Only Just Begun, hit no.2 in the USA. For the purposes of this book, to qualify as a Top 40
hit, a single or album must have entered the Top 40 singles/albums chart in at least one of eighteen featured
countries: Australia, Austria, Belgium, Canada, Denmark, Finland, France, Germany, Ireland (singles only),
Japan, the Netherlands, New Zealand, Norway, Spain, Sweden, Switzerland, the United Kingdom and the
United States of America. For both singles and albums, the main listing is followed by ‘The Almost Top 40
Singles/Albums’, which gives an honorable mention to Carpenters singles/albums that peaked between no.41
and no.50 in one or more countries. There is also a points-based list of the Top 20 Carpenters Singles and
Albums, plus a fascinating ‘Trivia’ section at the end of each section which looks at the most successful
Carpenters singles and albums in each of the featured countries.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Hunter:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or maybe read a book allowed Carpenters:
All The Top 40 Hits? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You recognize beside you can spend your time
using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have other
opinion?

Lynn Jordan:

This Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits book is not really ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this publication
incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get.
This Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits without we understand teach the one who reading through it become
critical in contemplating and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits can bring if
you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your
lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits having excellent arrangement in
word and also layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Sherry Hansen:

Do you among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits book is readable by simply you who hate
those perfect word style. You will find the information here are arrange for enjoyable reading through
experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
associated with Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits content conveys thinking easily to understand by lots of
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content material but it just different as it. So , do you
still thinking Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Sylvia Medina:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you go
through a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, due to the fact book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on
what kinds of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read
education books, but if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel,
comics, and also soon. The Carpenters: All The Top 40 Hits provide you with new experience in reading a
book.
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